To: Jeffrey Epsteinf[ieevacation@gmail.com)

Cc: Darren Indyke| T Rich Kahn
From: brice gordon

Sent: Tue 2/21/2012 3:29:53 PM

Subject: Fwd: main pool

LS.J main pool re-plaster.doc

Jeffrey

Rex is requesting the first14k draw of for the main pool replaster
Material will be on sight tomorrow so they can continue work

once pool 1s plastered then the second and final draw will be requested
does Rich have approval to wire funds?

---------- Forwarded message ----------

From: Rex Wolterman -
Date: Tue, Feb 21, 2012 at 9:47 AM

Subject: main pool

To: bryce gordon <G

Hi Brice,

The $14,000.00 draw for the Main Pool is due prior to bond coat.

We will be ready for bond coat today--Tuesday 2-21-12

Please have the funds wired as soon as possible to avoid any delays

Please confirm the material is On -Island today and will be on LSJ tomorrow
Hopefully everythings on schedule and plaster can be completed SAT--2-25-12
Good Day

Rex

Brice Gordon

Little Saint James
USVI
Phone; e
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