
To: Jeffrey Epsteinueevacationftmail.com] 
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent Thur 311120121:57:10 PM 
Subject Re: 

correct we have paid Rex only the first draw 14,000 draw 
14,000 remains outstanding until you approve 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F 
New York

NY 10065

On Feb 29, 2012, at 6:06 PM, Jeffrey Epstein wrote: 

I assume we did not pay rex his last pool draw? 

***** ****************************************************** 
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