To:  Richard Kahni |

From: Jeffrey Epstein
Sent: Wed 2/22/2012 2:31:44 PM
Subject: Re: NZ Flights

yes

On Wed, Feb 22, 2012 at 7:19 AM, Richard Kahn c_:f wrote:

1 know you mentioned flights were ok
wanted to verify approximate cost of 14,000 was also ok?

Richard Kahn
HBRK Associates Inc.
301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F
New York, NY 10065

Begin forwarded message:

From: brice gordon |GG

Date: February 22, 2012 7:50:24 AM EST
To: Rich Kahn
Subject: NZ Flights

Rich

Jeffrey has offered to pay for our flights back to NZ
the total cost will be around 14k.

Can we pay and you reimburse us.?

please advise

Brice Gvordon

The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute mside information, and 1s intended only for
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the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication i error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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