
To: Richard Kahn( 
From: jeffrey epstein 
Sent: Fri 1/20/2012 4:14:41 PM 
Subject: Re: 

Escrow 

Sony for all the typos .Sent from my iPhonc 

On Jan 20, 2012, at 11:14 AM, Richard Kahn a wrote: 

Happy Birthday 
Darren just mentioned that i should pay Erika 50% or 28,223.17 or her 56,446.34 
outstanding invoice 
Should i pay from your personal account? 
if so please advise where i should fiord from: 

JPM Trading 75,000,000 
DKI Escrow 3,700,000 
FTC Bear Stearns 3,400,000 
Haze Trust 5,100,000 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F 
New

York NY 10065
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