
To: Jeffrey Epsteinfieeyacation©gmail.com] 
From: Boris Nikolic 
Sent: Thur 1/5/2012 10:12:34 PM 
Subject: RE: Re: 

Sorry that it took so much time. 

Let's hope it will work. You have strong enemies there but I think they will not dare to block it. 

Are you still planning to be in Africa or could go to Davos as well? 

B 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com] 
Sent: Thursday, January 05, 2012 2:09 PM 
To: Boris Nikolic 
Subject: Re: 

thanks 

On Thu, Jan 5, 2012 at 5:00 PM, Boris Nikolic wrote: 

Great. 

I will connect Richard Kahn to Wendy Woska to help transferring ticket. 

B 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:ieeyacation(&cimail.com]
Sent: Thursday, January 05, 2012 1:56 PM 
To: Boris Nikolic 
Cc: Richard Kahn 
Subject: 
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ted ticket ok to purchase 
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