
To: jeevacation©gmail.com[jeevacation©gmail.com] 
From: Jennie Enterprise 
Sent Fri 1/27/2012 12:04:40 PM 
Subject: Re: 

Fed at 180....line of credit 50 K ... Amex we pay on the 8th is 25K ... Weekly expenses for business and 
personal ( almost all biz ) are 50K we have been funding deficits since the summer BUT for a several 
weeks we have gotten to the point where we r generating enough upgrades and new clients so no 
deficits ... Feel the fall drought is over and we r trending in the right direction ... 

CORE: Jennie Enterprise I 
Founder & Chairman I 66 East 55th Street New York NY 10022 

Main: Mobile 
www.coreaccess.net 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com] 
Sent: Friday, January 27, 2012 03:33 AM 
To: Jennie Enterprise 
Subject: Re: 

discipline.. how much do you owe on am ex. how much is the bank loan.? fed at 180. ? need 
to cut expenses? 

On Thu, Jan 26, 2012 at 9:13 AM, Jennie Enterprise < • wrote: 

Excited to see u today ! 

CORE: Jennie Enterprise I 
Founder & Chairman 166 East 55th Street New York NY 10022 

Mobile: 
www.coreacccss.net 

*********************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return c-mail or by c-mail to jcevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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