To: Bella Kiein [ NG

From: Jeffrey Epstein
Sent: Tue 12/13/2011 8:53:07 PM
Subject: Re: Dec Amex
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On Tue, Dec 13, 2011 at 1:22 PM. Bella Klein -:-‘_ wrote:

Dear Jeffrey,
Please confirm Ritz charges on your Amex. Jen confirmed all other charges.
Thank you,
Bella
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