
To: Richard Kahn 
From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent Fri 1/13/2012 7:44:21 AM 
Subject: Fwd: Peggy Siegal Inc reports 
PS 2011 40 60 split 2011 year end.pdf 
2011 payments to PS as of 12.12.2012.pdf 

please review, this seems odd I believe at the end of 2010 they still owed her money for that 
year on the 60 40split„ I have not reviewed this at all. but do not trust them 

 Forwarded messa e 
From: Katia Goldin 
Date: Thu, Jan 12, 2012 at 11:28 PM 
Subject: Peggy Siegal Inc reports 
To: JEEN TIONrsnail.com 
Cc: 

hi Jeffrey, 

Per Peggy's request please find attached 2011 year end report (60/40 split) and a list of payments 
Waggingtail made to Peggy Siegal Inc from 01/01/2011 - till today. 

If you have any questions do not hesitate to contact me. 

I will messenger a hard copy to Peggy's home on Tuesday per her request. 

Katia Goldin 

Accountant 
Bryan Bantry, Inc 
Wa 'n tail Entertainment Ltd 
ph: 

*********************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
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constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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