
To: Edouard Francis Rickert, 
Bradley 
From: Richard Bamett 
Sent Thur 12/15/2011 4:16:26 PM 
Subject.• FW: Bill payment 

Hi Francis I am back to work today please send me or email a final invoice for the scu up grade 
what is owed to my attention also Rich Kahn & Darren Endyke so i can get this issue resolved. 
Thanks Rich Barnett 

> From 
> To: 
> Date: Sun, 11 Dec 2011 05:32:12 +0000 
> Subject: Re: Bill payment 

> Hi Francis I am in the hospital and will be here for a few more da s to week please deal with 
Rich Kahn for bill payments please call me on my. Cell on sunday to discuss I have 
a lot of time on my hands being stuck in the hospital Thanks Richard Barnett. 
> Sent on the Sprint® Now Network from my BlackBerry® 

> Original Message 
> From: Edouard Francis 
> Date: Fri, 9 Dec 2011 20:39:23 
> To:
> Subject: Bill payment 

> Rich 
> As per my voicemail, It was brought to my attention that as of today no payment was sent since 
all the upgrades for the panels have been completed. An email as well as several invoices was sent 
to you and Richard Khan prior to the movement of our new office on 11/22/11. Please contact 
Richard khan in order to make the necessary arrangements for payment. 

> Thank you 

> Francis Edouard 
> Service Account Engineer 
> Siemens Industry, Inc. 
> Building Technologies Division 
> 8 Femwood Road 
> Florham Park, NJ 07932 
> Tel: 

> www.usa.siemens.com/buildingtechnologies 
<http://www.usa.siemens.com/buildingtechnologies> 

EFTA_R1_00242094 
EFTA01849768


