
To: Jeffrey Epsteinueevacation@gmailcomj 
From: Lesley Groff 
Sent Tue 11/22/2011 8:49:59 PM 
Subject Re: and money for Victor... 

great. $500 or $600? 
On Nov 22, 2011, at 3:45 PM, Jeffrey Epstein wrote: 

ok 

On Tue, Nov 22, 2011 at 3:44 PM, Lesley Groff wrote: 

is checking in again rc money for her prescription...she is hoping to pick up 
money tomorrow...please advise. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Date: November  PM E 
To: "Lesley Groff' 
Subject: Re: Dr. Victor 
Reply-To: 

Dear I hope I can hear from you today later. 
said that my prescription will be expired by tomorrow. So to by medicine I 

can do only today( I can't because I have a shoot until the late 
evening) or tomorrow( I can do anytime) and If I'll miss this days 
then I have to wait 20 days again for to renew my prescription which 

will be break my treatment. This is how this system work asM 
said to me. 

I am a little worry;(( 

Sorry for keep sending you my notes. But let me know if you'll have any news. 
Thank you so much again. 

Sent on the Sprint® Now Network from my BlackBerry® 

******** ********* ********* ********* ************************ 
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confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@amail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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