
To: 

From: je y epstem 
Sent: Sat 11/12/2011 3:11:28 PM 
Subject: Re: 

When , show me 

Sorry for all the typos .Sent from my iPhone 

On Nov 12, 2011, at 2:53 PM 

Sorry for the late reply I have just got service back after yesterday blackout 
You approved the plant selection 
Igala pricedAnd it is just a invoice 
It has not been paid 
How do you wish to proceed 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Nov 12, 2011, at 3:22 AM, Jeffrey Epstein leevacationlaginail.com> wrote: 

on yesterdays call igala said he order axorias for the red thorn road. I 
have repeatedly said , that no new plants were to be ordered and the 
nursery should be emptied. WHO approved the purchase„ Who 
negotaited the prive WHO paid the bill. ?? 

*********************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@amail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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