
To: Bella 
Cc: 
From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent Wed 9/7/20116:10:13 PM 
Subject Re: Dr. Magnani 

yes„ but pay the entire amount.. thanks. 

On Wed, Sep 7, 2011 at 1:58 PM, Bella Klein ne> wrote: 

Do I have your permission to pay $440 for Anastasiya visit to Dr Magnani on June 3rd as the 
appointment was scheduled by Lesley? Total amount due for Anstasiya is $2215. Bill 
attached. 
Thank you 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: RingCentral < 
Date: September 7, 2011 12:35:13 PM EDT 
To: Bella Klein < 
Subject: New Fax Message from 
12:35 PM 

You Have a New Fax Message 

n 09/07/2011 at 

From: 

Received: Wednesday. September 07. 2011 at 12:35 PM 

Pages: 1 

To: (Bella Klein) 

To view this message, please open the attachment or login to your RingCentral 
account by clicking here. 

Thank you for using RingCentrai. 

Love RingCentral? Refer a friend 

*********************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
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confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@amail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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