
To: 
Fran: 
Sent 
Subject 

Jeffrey Epstein 
Thur 10/27/2011 7:46:51 PM 
Re: Fwd: Bentley repair 

no idea,1 told jojo to bring in the car period 

On Thu, Oct 27, 2011 at 3:46 PM, wrote: 

This is first time I've heard about this,.not sure why Bella is spearheading car maintenanee,.and 
I'm not in the loop 

Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T 

From: Jeffrey Epstein <jconcationgonail com> 
Date: Thu, 27 Oct 2011 15:35:06 -0400 
To: 
Subject: Fwd: Bentley repair 

larry can you tell me what a 21k thousand dollar repair is for.? 

 Forwarde 
From: Bella Klein  
Date: Thu, Oct 27, 2011 at 2:16 PM 
Subject: Bentley repair 
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jet:\ acationagmail.com>

Attached please find a quote for Bentley service and repairs. Total cost is $17063.66. They will 
try to repair the wheels. If the wheels to be replaced it will be additional charge of $4,684. 

Please advise if it is ok to proceed. 
Thank you, 
Bella 

Begin forwarded mcssa : 

From: 
Dat- • orAmmatissunow I 4: - I to 
To: 
Subject: Messa e from KMBT C253 
Reply-To: 

EFTA_R1_00250885 
EFTA01854530



*********************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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