
To: Richard Kahn 
From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent Thur 10/6/2011 6:23:28 PM 
Subject: Re: VI Gunite - October 6. 2011 

gary says that we owe him 54k , and he wants to release 20k„ If that total is coorect.. -realease 

On Thu, Oct 6, 2011 at 8:22 PM, Richard Kahn wrote: 

wanted to confirmed you gave gary ok to release 20k to vi gunite 
Richard Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 
301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F 

New York NY 10065 
tel 
fax 
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Daphne Wallace 
Date: October 6, 2011 12:37:07 PM EDT 
To: Rich Kahn Gary Kerney 

Subject: VI Gunite - October 6, 2011 

Greetings Rich, 

Gary spoke to JE this morning. JE approved the release of $20,000 to this vendor. Gary 
is requesting a wire today please: 

VI Gunite: $ 20,000 (Requisition 6-REVISED: Flagpole Pool (1013) 13-150) 

Please advise, DW 

*********************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
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Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacationegmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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