To: jeffrey epstein[jeevacation@gmail.com]
From: Gary Kerney

Sent: Wed 9/21/2011 8:19:47 PM

Subject: RE: RE:

This would be what | would expect a subcontractor to make and if he's good he'll work about 50% of the time all
in and the other 50% he will spend finding work and in between jobs.

their time starts and stops at the dock,we know what Marcos gels

Assume Tyson pays himself  $50/hr.x45hr.  $2250
lead stone mason Marcos gets 335/hr, x45hr. $1575
stone masons  (2) @ 25 $50x45 §2250
labor (2)@ 12 $24x45 $1080

From: jeffrey epstein [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com]
Sent: Wed 9/21/2011 3:42 PM

To: Gary Kerney

Subject: Re: RE:

You tell me if that looks like 1000 per week per person . It seems so

Sorry for all the typos .Sent from my iPhone

On Sep 21, 2011, at 3:01 PM, "Gary Kerney" <|| G- o

tile layer $25,000 breakdown of my estimate

the terrace and pool deck will run just under $18,000 and take about 3 weeks crew
of Chris and 4 people. | allowed in the $25,000 some flexability to allow me to have Saint to do
the bath terrace, floors of the bath and cottage 4 in case our inhouse tile layers couldn't keep
up,which would also extend the time or add more people

Tyson $38,000 breakdown of my estimate

we got today a bill $10,908 for the past two weeks leaving $27,000 bal.
| looked at the work to be done this moming and whats left is closer to $20,000 and at
least 3 weeks and its Tyson and 5 workers

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com]
Sent: Wed 9/21/2011 7:31 AM

To: Gary Kerney

Subject: Re:

yes proceed.. |, but explain how a tile layer with even 10 emplyees, full time on this | gets
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12 thousand a week?

On Tue, Sep 20, 2011 at 4:57 PM, Gary Kerney <}

wrote;
Jeffrey

over the next 30 days we have 3 subs listed below doing the work below on a cash basis.|
need your authorization to have them continue working and me give them local checks.

Rodney Rusphille did the collum wall and sea wall.

currently has a invoice in for $34,368.04 for the main terrace wall that needs a
check to pay his men and show back up.

| have him scheduled to do the balance of the motor court wall we laid out and
should start tomorrow. will be about 525,000 two draws and we're done with motor court
walls

Gassie Comer Stone ( Tyson) he is doing the stone veneer on cottage 4 and the little
bath,this was budgeted work that | explained the varience and the extra in my sept.12th
email

he will bill ancther $38,000 in two or three draws over three weeks and we're done

Saint Tile they did the flag pole coral deck.He is starting the big terrace tomorrow and then
the pool deck

$25,000 total ,he'll make two or three draws done in about three weeks

when you were here we talked about Brices cottage cabinets and their being over but other
line items being under and | was to proceed

Authorized for the above?
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The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of
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Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail. com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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