To:  emad hanno( I

From: jeffrey epstein

Sent: Wed 8/17/2011 2:13:08 PM
Subject: Re: LSJ Qld Verado Engines.
Yes

Sorry for all the typos .Sent from my iPhone

On Aug 17, 2011, at 4:05 PM, emad hanna _ wrote:

Jeffrey,

We had an offer of $4,500 for the two old Verado engines on LSJ and we asked the guy
for an additional $1,000 and he agreed to give $5,500.

Larry said he was ok with this price and we just wanted to get your blessing on this.
Because LSJ staff already told this guy to come pick them up at noon today.

Please advise
Thank you
Emad Hanna
Project Controller

HBRK Associates
3201 East 66th St

Suite 10F

LSJ Office
St. Thomas Office
NY Office
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