
To: Jeffrey Epsteinueevacation@gmail.com] 
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent Tue 8/30/2011 6:58:19 PM 
Subject Re: 

11. SEPTEMBER 1 REMINDER - APT COSTS 

JEAN LUC 18,195 

.9 ,774 
27,839 

Please advise. 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F 
New York. NY 10065 

tel
fa 
eel 

On Aug 30, 2011, at 2:46 PM, Jeffrey Epstein wrote: 

give me the payments for jean lucs appt. 
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