
To: emad henna 
From: Jeffrey epstein 
Sent Wed 8/10/2011 2:06:10 PM 
Subject: Re: Flagpole Pool Project Air Conditioning 

Ok 

Sorry for all the typos .Sent from my 'Phone 

On Aug 10, 2011, at 5:48 PM, emad hanna wrote: 

Jeffrey, 
Please advise on the below I sent on August 5th 

Thank you 

Emad Hanna 
Project Controller 
HBRK Associates 
301 East 66th St 

Suite 10F 
New 
Cell 

LSJ Office 
St. Thomas Office 

NY Office 
Fax 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: emad hanna 
Date: August 5, 2011 11:58:39 AM EDT 
To: Jeffrey Epstein leevacationeximail.com>
Cc: Rich Kahn 
Subject: Flagpole Pool ProjectMi. or Conditioning 

Jeffrey, 
I just received a requisition to pay $12,817.77 which is 1/2 of the contract totaling 

$25,635.55 
The equipment has already been delivered and installed and awaiting electrical 

supply to start it up. 

Please advise of approval so that I can process this payment 
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Thank you 

Emad Hanna 
Project Controller 
HBRK Associates 
301 East 66th St 
Suite 10F 
New York, NY 10065 
Cell 
LSJ Office (340) 775-8127 
St. Thomas Office (340) 775-2525 
NY Office (646) 862-4815 
Fax (646) 350-0221 
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