
To: 
From: 111,stem 
Sent Sat 8/27/2011 11:22:40 AM 
Subject: Fwd: 

what was rod paying„ ? arc we getting screwd 

 Forwarded message 
From: Cecile de Jong 
Date: Sat, Aug 27, 2011 at 1:20 PM 
Subject: Re: 
To: Jeffrey Epstein leevacationOgmail.com>
Cc: lvjet <INJET@Aol.com>

BTW, what size is his hangar and do we know what he pays/mo? TWA will be at $12/s1 

With warm regards, 
Cecile 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Aug 27, 2011, at 7:04 AM, Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacationOgmail.com> wrote: 

you can go to lsj whencer you want .. to start working on hangar„ i think before 
we beign we should ask cleo hodge to switch with us. he can't afford his current 

*********************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jecvacation@smail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

*********************************************************** 

EFTA_R1_00260016 
EFTA01860293



The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return c-mail or by e-mail to jccvacation@gmail.com and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

EFTA_R1_00260017 

EFTA01860294


