To:  George Reenstr

From: Jeffrey Epstein
Sent: Thur 777722011 10:15:16 PM
Subject: Re: FW: 472

ok

On Thu, Jul 7, 2011 at 6:10 PM, George Reenstra — wrote:

| reread the agreement for March and made a mistake in the price, he agreed to
pay 1.8mnot1.7m so we each make an extra 50K

George Reenstra

Aircraft Services Group Inc

Tel [

Fax

Website:

Email

From: George Reenstra
Sent: Thursday, July 07, 2011 5:45 PM
To: Jeffrey Epstein
Subject: 472

| had a buyer for the helicopter several months ago. He is Nigerian so naturally
everything stopped. His AGENT called me earlier today and now is according to
his AGENT ready to proceed ASAP. His deal was buying the ship at 1.7m AS IS.

The deal is as follows
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750 11.9m less 100k to me

472 1.7m less 100k to me

You make 11.9m for 750 and are out and clean.

If | can get him to the table a strongly suggest you take it, he will not pay more since
that is where his head his and will switch to a B model which he can purchase for
the same price.

| am speaking to him in the morning at 0800 so need your response.

As for the deal running through my books for you | am glad to do it just need to figure
out the path.

George Reenstra

Aircraft Services Group Inc
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The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 15 the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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