
To: Gary Kemey.
Cc: emad hanna 
From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent Sat 7/30/2011 5:47:05 PM 
Subject Re: pool 
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i approved.. so please check 

On Sat, Jul 30, 2011 at 10:25 AM, Gary Kerney wrote: 

we will have the deck at the flagpole done the end fo next week and ready to finish the pool plaster. 
we did not pay Bart ,and he calls me every day. 
If we are not going to pay him I don't expect to get him back to do more work 

Direction? 
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