
To: Richard Kahn 
From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent Tue 7/19/2011 8:25:51 PM 
Subject: Re: Dave Rodgers 

ok 

On Tue, Jul 19, 2011 at 3:38 PM, Richard Kahn wrote: 

I explained to Dave that you would like to pay him the difference of time worked 66,000 vs 
25,000 paid for a net of 41,000 thru the first 6 months of the year. 

Dave if we could reconcile at the end of the year and defer the income to January 2012 similar to 
how we handled last year. 

Please advise if this is ok? 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F 
New York, NY 10065 
tel 
fax 
cel 
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