
To: emad henna 
From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent Thur 6/23/2011 4:18:25 PM 
Subject: Re: LSJ Citrus Garden 

no., it makes no sense 

On Thu, Jun 23, 2011 at 11:56 AM, emad hanna wrote: 

Jeffrey, 
Irrigation material needed for this job totals $4,145.89 which does not contain any inventory it 
is all needed for this project. 

Do I have your approval to order this? 

Thank you 

Emad Hanna 
Project Controller 
HBRK Associates 
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