
To: Jeffrey Epsteinijeevacationggmail.comj 
From: emad hanna 
Sent Wed 6/22/2011 8:34:01 PM 
Subject Fwd: LSJ Trucking Invoice 

Jeffery, 
Just a follow up from last week regarding this invoice 

Please advise if I can process this payment 

Thank you 

Emad Hanna 
Project Controller 
HBRK Associates 
301 East 66th St 

Suite 10F 
New York, NY 10065 
Cell (340) 642-8763 

LSJ Office (340) 775-8127 
St. Thomas Office (340) 775-2525 

NY Office (646) 8624815 
Fax (646) 350-0221 

emad.hanna01 gmail.com 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: emad hanna <emad.hanna01 qmail.com>
Date: June 15, 2011 3:08:35 PM EDT 
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com>
Subject: LSJ Trucking Invoice 

Jeffrey, 
I followed up some more and it makes no difference if the truck is running or not running 

during waiting time. LSJ hired the truck and he was told the cargo was cleared and 
to be there 1st thing in the morning and he got there and the cargo was not cleared 
and he contacted LSJ and they told him they were working on clearing the cargo 
and he ended up waiting at Tropical for 4 hours before the cargo was cleared. 

LSJ should not be dispatching a truck until they know the cargo has been cleared. 

This bill had 16 pick up runs and the total is $4,487.50 

Please advise if your ok with the above. 
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Thank you 

Emad Hanna 
Project Controller 
HBRK Associates 
301 East 66th St 
Suite 10F 
New York, NY 10065 
Cell (340) 642-8763 
LSJ Office (340) 775-8127 
St. Thomas Office (340) 775-2525 
NY Office (646) 862-4815 
Fax (646) 350-0221 
emad.hanna01 omail.com 
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