From: Richard Kahn
Sent: Tue 5/31/2011 3:14:54 PM
Subject: Re: Daughter

confirming tuition of 23k is to be paid along with loan paperwork - 1 will use a 5 year term

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.
301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F
New York, NY 100685

On May 28, 2011, at 12:29 PM, Jeffrey Epstein wrote:

yes
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From:

Date: Sat, May 28, 2011 at 11:57 AM
Subject: Daughter

To: Je vacation

Jeftrey,
Brooke's Benjamin school tuition is $23,000 is due June Ist,.for your consideration for
Loan,.

I will continue to work harder and due what ever it takes to assist all aspects of our
operations and needs.

[ think you value my opinion and decision making in all arcas, whether It pertains to
planes, helicopter, boats and stereo's ,, you know I negotiate the best prices for us.

Thank you for all your support in me, and my family.

Larry

Is this approved?
Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T
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The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copymg of this
communication or any part thercof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return ¢-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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