
To: Richard Kahn 
From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent Fri 4/15/2011 5:10:17 PM 
Subject: Re: Gift Tax Extension 

ok 

On Fri, Apr 15, 2011 at 12:30 PM, Richard Kahn > wrote: 

My schedule shows $50,561 due and George agrees with that number, however he wants you 
to pay $60,000 with estimate due 4/18/2011 

is this ok? 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
301 East 66th Street, Suite I OF 
New Ynrk NY 10065 
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The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
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Jeffrey Epstein 
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