To:  emad hann

From: Jeffrey Epstein
Sent: Thur 6/272011 6:05:18 PM

Subject: Re: LSJ Flagpole Pool

no for what??

On Thu, Jun 2, 2011 at 8:04 PM, emad hanna -_::r wrote:

Jeffrey,

Just wanted to confirm that vou approved to Gary a change order for Glidden electrical work
in the amount of $52,074 added to the original contract of $23,750 making it a total of
$75,824.

We have paid $12,500 from the original contract and I have a request for $19,111.20 to process.
Do I have your approval?

Thank you

Emad Hanna
Project Controller
HERK Associates
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The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-chient privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressce. It 1s the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this

EFTA_R1_00268023
EFTA01865351



communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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