
To: 
From: 
Sent Fri 4/15/2011 2:15:04 PM 
SubSet Re: CDW-D Quote #CBXW695 - PO Ref: TOUGHBOOK 

what does that mean, it is for the generator. Is this a specialized laptop or not.. 

On Fri, Apr 15, 2011 at 10:12 AM,  wrote: 

FYI 
this is also for New Generator plant and heavy machinery as well 

On Fri, Apr 15, 2011 at 11:05 AM, Scott Denett cz wrote: 

Brice has requested this notebook for the maintenance on your bikes and ATVs.... on LSJ 
 I think it is a good idea as the last laptop was smashed during a repair and I think this is a 
fair mid-level model as they can cost over 6k 

If you approve I can order today to make the next lsj trip 

this order cost is $3,114.14 

scott 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Date: ril 15 2011 9:47:55 AM EDT 
To: 
Subjec : - uo e #CBXW695 - PO Ref: TOUGHBOOK 

This e-mail best viewed in a fixed font such as Courier. 

Dear Scott Denett 

CDW has received your request. Please take a moment to review the attached Quote for 
accuracy and completeness. 

If you find any discrepancies or need further assistance, please feel free to contact your 
CDW account manager. 

Thank you for choosing CDW. 
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*PLEASE NOTE: To read this attachment, you must have Adobe Acrobat Reader 
installed on your computer. If you do not have Adobe Acrobat Reader, you can 
download it for free from help vk adobe COM 

Little Saint James 
USVI 

******* ****** ************************** ******************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, plc 
return e-mail or by c-mail to nd 
destroy this communication an a copies iereo , 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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