
To: Richard Kah 
From: Jeffrey Epste 
Sent Wed 4/27/2011 5:57:07 PM 
Subject: Re: outstanding $ 

yes have veronoka pay. yes ask freja. 

On Wed, Apr 27, 2011 at 12:42 PM, Richard Kahn < • wrote: 

a) freja - sent multiple requests for her to collect and or pay remaining $900 
b) victor- balance outstanding $10k - spoke with him this am and he is going to try to pay some 

money this week 
c) mc2 - made another 10k payment this week - balance outstanding 764.5k 
d) veronika - 5,000 (should i follow up?) 

please advise 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F 
New York, NY 10065 
tel 
fax 
cell 
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