From: Jeffrey Epstein
Sent: Thur 4721/2011 5:21:22 PM
Subject: Re: George Delson

no not until july,, have geroge call me

On Thu, Apr 21, 2011 at 10:53 AM, Richard Kahn _ wrote:

Confirming 70,000 from FTC is ok to pay and release today for George FTC accounting fees
for 1/1/2010 - 12/31/2010.
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