
To: jeevaca • " tion©gmail.com] 
Cc: Sarah K 
From: brice gor on 
Sent: Mon 5/9/2011 6:45:25 PM 
Subject: Fwd: Projector Update 

Jeffrey 
forwarded projector update for your review, how do you wish to proceed? 

Brice 

 Forwarded! 
From: nick lambros 
Date: Thu, May 5, 2011 at : 
Subject: Projector U ate 

Gentleman Below is what was sent to me yesterday Afternoon. 

"Good afternoon Nick, 

All of the parts needed for your repair are either in stock or have been ordered from the manufacturer. At this 
time, I expect to be able to complete your order in two weeks. Unfortunately, the average order for 
electronics is taking approximately (3-4) weeks from order date until the parts are received at our facility. I 
have expedited your request to upper management (our VP of Operations) because of the location of the 
projector and urgency of the repair and am diligently shooting for 2 weeks. If in any way I can get them 
before that 2 week time frame, I will notify you immediately. I apologize for the delay on the arrival of the 
electronics, we are working closely with the manufacturer to greatly improve this matter." 

This is already in the works and ordered and waiting the for them to arrive. 
As far as the 3D upgrade they said the would do a trade in for a New 3D 1080 Ultra Bright with trade in for 
$18135.00 and this is my cost. This is the last time they will offer any kind of trade in. 

Please advise as to how we would like to proceed. 

Nick 

Nick Lambros 
Chicago Audio Video Design. 
Dba.Sound X 
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Brice Gordon 
Little Saint James 

EFTA_R1_00272709 

EFTA01868409


