
To: Richard Kahn 
Cc: Emad Hanna 
Bcc: jeevacation©gmail.com[jeevacahon©gmail.corn] 
From: 
Sent Wed 4/27/2011 9:52:36 PM 
Subject Re: Terminix-3-21-11 

Good Afternoon, 
As per JE's direction the Terminx contact is fine at the moment and we will address any new 

structures andbuildings as they occur 
Thanks 
Warmest regards 

On Tue, Apr 26, 2011 at 3:28 PM, Richard Kahn wrote: 

i would like the contract revised to specifically reference all buildings to be serviced for their 
monthly fee. 
i believe that this will ensure no confusion over costs moving forward 
would you like me or emad to contact vendor or will you? 

thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc 

On Apr 24, 2011, at 3:33 PM, wrote: 

Good Afternoon Rich 
Sony no old contact from Professional Killers is on file, unless Daphne you 

have one hidden away. I had asked if she could provide any backup, she 
received complete control of the company via her divorce and really had 
nothing, another concern on our end 

Reference your concerns about missing buildings 
(a) Laundry is the managers cottage (same building) Laundry will be moved up 
to the main compound within the next few weeks, at that point it will fall 
under Cottage I (same building) 
(b) Kitchen is the Great Room Building 
(c) Captain Office is the Workshop. The Captains Office will be relocated once 
mechanical buildings are completed 
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I see no reason for them to revise their contract and as noted on their contract 
"new structures on LSJ will be inspected before added to the monthly service" 
There is no way anyone could give an estimate before a structure was built, 
depending what it is made of location, size this all would have to be reviewed 
and inspected once completed 

I hope this answers all your questions and concerns, again I apologize for the 
delay with this response 
Warmest regards 

On Wed, Mar 23, 2011 at 2:02 PM, Rich Kahn wrote: 

Savings sounds great — nice job 

Do you have a copy of the old contract so we can compare to the new one? 

In addition a few structures were missing from the contract under INVESTMENT: 

a) Laundry Room 

b) Kitchen 

c) Captains Office 

I assume those all will be included as part of 750 per month quote 

For future what will cost be for additional structures? 

Please have them revise contract after we speak 

Thank you 
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Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

From 

Sent: Monday, March 21, 2011 1:33 PM 
To: 
Cc: Richard Kahn; 
Subject: Terminix-3-21-11 

Good Afternoon, 

As of date LSJ will no longer be using Proffessional Killers for exterminating, please 
note attached Terminix Contract who will be the new vendor 

If there are any questions or concerns please E Mail 

Warmest regards 

LSJ, LLC 

Island Manager 
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LSJ,LLC 
Island Manager 

LSJ,LLC 
Island Manager 
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