To:  brice gordor|

From: Jeffrey Epstein
Sent: Thur 8/2/2012 10:32:41 PM
Subject: Re: Kawasaki 750 ATV EPS

ok

On Thu, Aug 2, 2012 at 6:29 PM, brice gordon _ wrote:

demo bike here by 11am, is that ok

On Thu, Aug 2, 2012 at 4:12 PM, brice gordon _wmtu:

2012 500 bikes cost 6200 each (without front & rear guards) however we received a 750 rebate per bike

On Thu, Aug 2, 2012 at 12:06 PM, Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote:

how much did we pay

On Thu, Aug 2, 2012 at 11:25 AM, BMG | | NG o -

2013 model Red approx availability Oct

You could demo a black 2012 with power steering on the ranch tomorrow
Would require $500.00 deposit refundable

Should I arrange demo at ranch

They would take Polaris 500 as trade approx $4000.00 each

Sent from my iPhone
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The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

leffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copyving of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
nd may be unlawtul. If vou have recerved this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
eturn e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@gmail.com, and
destroy this commumnication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments, copyright -all rights reserved
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Brice Gsordon
Little Saint James
LISVI

Brice Gordon

Little Saint James
USVI

Phone: 340 513 9855
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The mformation contained in this communication 1s
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jecvacation(@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

EFTA_R1_00278378
EFTA01872012



