To: ichar hn

Cc: wleffrey Epstein[jeevacation@gmail.com)
From:

Sent: Thur 8/2/2012 7:29:02 PM

Subject: Re: paris bed

The bed has not been delivered yet. They said approximately 6 weeks which takes us to Aug 18th
from date of payment.

On Thu, Aug 2, 2012 at 3:18 PM, Richard Kahn f-_} wrote:

Attached paperwork is for Paris bed showing it was ordered on 7/7/2012 for a cost of
5.,946.95 Euro

Has bed been delivered vet? if not do you know expected delivery date?

Thank you
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