
To: Jeffrey[jeevacation@gmail.com] 
From: 
Sent: Thur 7/26/2012 6:27:09 PM 
Subject: Re: 

sorry, what does that mean? They won't start retouching until they receive 
payment. 

On Jul 26, 2012, at 2:12 PM, Jeffrey wrote: 

> Let's see after 25 

> Sorry for all the typos .Sent from my iPhone 

On Jul 26, 2012, at 2:10 PM,  wrote: 

>> Michael Weinstein is requesting full payment of $6500 for the photos of 71st 
before they begin retouching them. May I make this payment? 
>> Also, you only chose 42 images and you are entitled to 50. Would you like 
Michael to choose the remaining 8 photos? 
>> 
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