To: Jeffrey Epstein[jeevacation@gmail. com)
From:
Sent: Thur 6/21/2012 2:35:31 PM

Subject: Re:IEd Cuccia

ok, thanks
On Jun 21, 2012, at 10:34 AM, Jeffrey Epstein wrote:

no,, she can pay

On Thu, Jun 21, 2012 at 9:57 AM, || | G - o

I have made - an appt for Monday June 25th at 2pm. The consultation is
$100. Would you like me to pay this now with a CC?

Ed Cuccia

100 Lafyette St., Room 201 (close to Canal)

[ will send this information on to Karyna.
On Jun 21, 2012, at 9:49 AM, Jefirey Epstein wrote:

yes for monday

On Th, Jun 21,2012 at 9-47 An T o

[ ran in m- on the street and she was asking me about her
appt with Ed Cuccia. Did you wish me to make her an appt with
Ed?
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