
To: Monique Ham/IMMMIIIIMIME 
From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent Thur V19/2012 7:52:47 PM 
Subject: Re: FW: Betteroads 

yes 

On Thu, Jul 19, 2012 at 12:16 PM, Monique Harry se • wrote: 

Good Day , 

Attached Betteroads invoice 208690 in the amount of $6,000.00 for Asphalt Strip @ side of hill 
Main Compound. Is it Ok to process for payment? 

MONIQUE HARRY 
Project Administrator 
LSJ, LLC 
6100 Red Hook Qtr Suite 133 
St. Thomas, 
Telephone 
Fax 

********* ********* *************** ************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any pan thereof is strictly prohibited 
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