To: Jeffrey Epstein[jeevacation@gmail.com

ce:  Dapne wallaco
From: Richard Kahn

Sent: Fri 6/15/2012 7:03:38 PM

Subject: Fwd: Trash Bins

Brice 15 looking to purchase 2 new garbage bins for a total cost of 12,922.66
Do i have your approval to proceed?

PLEASE NOTE EFFECTIVE JUNE 5TH MY CONTACT INFO WILL BE AS
FOLLOWS:

Richard Kahn
HBRK Associates Inc.

New York, New York 10022

tel
fax
cell

Begin forwarded message:

From: Daphne Wallace GG
Date: June 11, 2012 2:06:23 PM EDT

To: Richard Kann |
Subject: Re: Trash Bins

Greetings Rich,

. Purchasing 2 new garbage bins was not on the punch list as of today;
When LSJ purchased the bins in 2007 they cost $3,345 each - in 2012 will cost $4,313
cach
. Shipping of the 4 bins in 2007 (B/L 7289421: WITE Bins) cost $5,654 - in 2012
shipping of 2 estimated at
S 4296.66

I3

Lad

On Mon, Jun 11, 2012 at 12:27 PM, Richard Kahn — wrote:

1s this on punch list 7
can you please investigate and sce if there pricing is accurate
thank you

From: brice gorcon |

Date: June 11, 2012 1:45:53 PM EDT
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To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: Trash Bins

approved to go ahead and replace, has not seen the final figure
unsure what craig disgusted with him

On Mon, Jun 11, 2012 at 1:28 PM, Richard Kahn _ wrote:

Has jee approved the purchase of 2 new trash bins?

Begin forwarded message:

From: brice gordon [ NG
Date: June 10, 2012 10:53:09 AM EDT
To: Rich Kahn

Ce: I

Subject: Trash Bins

Requesting approval for the purchase of two new trash bin for LSJ, existing bins are
beyond repairing and will disappear once we get the last major load
of trash off the island

2 x 30yd bins HD Dark Green $8626.00
shipping 4296.60

Total $12922.66

please advise
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