
To: 
From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent Mon 7/30/2012 10:24:43 AM 
Subject Re: Toy store 

yes 

On Mon, Jul 30, 2012 at 6:17 AM, wrote: 

Jeffrey, 
I met with Clayton the shop manager at Toy store on Friday, he is committed to doing anything 

to please you in regards to headrest. 
Gary is asking for payment of the final $36,500 we owe to Toy store be funded. Gary has 

stressed they need operating funds, and is embarrassed to ask for payment at this time, email 
below, he promises to rectify the atm rest and any issue we have with interior. 

Do you approve of payment to toy store $36,500 or portion there of? 
Thx, Larry 

From Gary: 
Larry, 
I am on the side of the road in a broken Ferrari but I will call you tonight. Let me assure you that 

my guys will finish this project to your desire. It would be great if you could get me funded on 
Monday! 

Gary 
Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T 
Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T 
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