
To: Jeffrey EpsteinUeeyacationagmail.comj 
From: Jeanne Brennan 
Sent Wed 6/20/2012 5:35:34 PM 
Subject: RE: Danny Vicars 

Ok. 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com] 
Sent: Wednesday, June 20, 2012 1:20 PM 
To: Jeanne Brennan 
Subject: Re: Danny Vicars 

talk to danny direct. and tell him the insurance is 20k.. that you will go tome , but you think it is 
a mistake. 

On Wed, Jun 20, 2012 at 12:09 PM, Jeanne Brennan 

Brice just called me he made the offer to Danny and Danny wants 73K. 

Please advise. 

Jeanne 

From: Jeffrey [mailto:ieevacationegmail.com]
Sent: Wednesday, June 20, 2012 11:02 AM 
To: Jeanne Brennan 
Subject: Re: Danny Vicars 

wrote: 

Yes 

Sorry for all the typos .Sent from my iPhone 

On Jun 20, 2012, at 10:58 AM, "Jeanne Brennan" a wrote: 

JeltreY. 

I just came from the Island .Brice asked me about Danny Vicars and his package. I told him that 70K was the figure that I had 
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discussed with you and health insurance . which with his wife is a 20K+ benefit as well as holidays (which are not an ICI 
benefit). 

He told me that Danny Vicars had originally asked Brice for 76K. 

And that Brice wanted to bring him on ASAP. 

Should I confirm with Brice the $70,000 and a start dale MAP. 

Jeanne 

*************************************** ******************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return c-mail or bye-mail to ksvacationia:email corn, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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