
To: Richard Kahn 
From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent Mon 6/25/2012 4:51:37 PM 
Subject Re: 

yes 

On Mon, Jun 25, 2012 at 6:50 PM, Richard Kahn wrote 

20k for what period of time? 
paid in monthly installments of? 
should we draft formal agreement? 

PLEASE NOTE EFFECTIVE JUNE 5TH MY CONTACT INFO WILL BE AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor. 
New York, New York 10022 
tel 
faxes 

cell 

On Jun 25, 2012, at 12:19 PM, Jeffrey Epstein wrote: 

as christina is doing foundation work lets give her 20k from the foundation to 
mangge its website 
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