
To: in evacationa 
Cc: 
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Tue 6/5/2012 10:29:17 PM 
Subject: Fwd: 8H 

Is this approved? 
PLEASE NOTE EFFECTIVE JUNE 5TH MY CONTACT INFO WILL BE AS 

FOLLOWS: 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

tel 
fax 

cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: A Barrett 
Date: June 5, 2012 4 27 48 PM EDT 
To: Rich Kahn 
Cc:

u jec : 

Rich, 

Just to confirm that Penn has the go ahead to proceed on the bathroom construction. The 
coat for his labor only is $12,500 ( this includes new plumbing and electric). All 
material will be supplied by 

A separte authorization for the a/c covers of $1,000 is still to be approved. 

Thanks 

Anthony Barrett 
Ossa Properties, Inc. 
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