
To: Jeanne Brenna 
Fran: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent Fri 6/15/2012 8:27:31 PM 
Subject Re: An' charges Melvin's phone 

darren quesiton 

On Fri, Jun 15, 2012 at 4:22 PM, Jeanne Brennan wrote: 

II and stated that he bad but he couldn t reach
calle this morning as they had not sent 

' 
and joigione over to the 

to get his phone. 
Normal protocol is for these to be turned in on exit sign off. The ATT bill arrived this 
afternoon and there is $2400 worth of charges on Melvin's phone. Most roaming in the DR as 
of 6/2/2012. 

Do you want to cancel the phone ASAP? It's an Iphone and may have some tracking capacity. 

Should we report the charges to ATT as off a stolen phone. 

Please advise. 

Jeanne 
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