
To: Epstein JeffreyDeevacationagmail.comj 
From: 
Sent Thur 6/21/2012 9:36:11 PM 
Subject: Fwd: Chartered Plane/June 29 

Peggys office is following up on this again. ... 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Allison Reddington < 
Date: June 21 2012 12:22:39 PM 
To: 
Subject: hartered Plane/June 29 

Hey Lesley! 

How are you doing?? 

So Jeffrey is paying for Peggy's charter flight from Pittsfield to East Hampton on 
Friday, June 296. 

I just spoke to Eric from the East Hampton Airport and he said that they need a 
credit card number in order to book the flight. 

Is there any way we could make the payment today? I know that it is kind of fast 
but Peggy just told me about it. The phone number is (631) 537-2202. 

Thanks again for your help! 

Best, 

Allison 
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Allison Reddington 

Assistant to Peggy Siegal 

Peggy Siegal Company 

750 Lexington Avenue 

51" Floor 

New York, NY 10022 

212.935.6700 
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