
To: Richard Kahn[ 
Cc: Jeffrey Eastein 
From: 
Sent: 
Subject: Re: press releases 

evacation@gmail.com] 

Sat 6/16/2012 3:02:21 AM 

Hi Rich, 

I received the wire for 52,613 to cover the cost of the next batch of press. 

Thanks and hope your son is okay. 

cell: 
email: 

--- On Fri, 6/15/12, Richard Kahn < > wrote: 

From: Richard Kahn •cl .=> 
Subject: Re: ress releases 
To: ' 
Date: Friday, June 15, 2012, 2:10 PM 

thanks for your concern and patience 
wire just sent and should be in your account by 5pm 

PLEASE NOTE EFFECTIVE JUNE 5TH MY CONTACT INFO WILL BE AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York. New York 10022 
tel 
fax 

cell 

On Jun 14, 2012, at 10:30 PM, wrote: 

Hi Rich, 

No worries. I'm hope 
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On Jun 14, 2012, at 4:05 PM, Richard Kahn a wrote: 

i left work early as 
Wire will go out in the am 
Sorry for the delay 

From: 
Date: Thu, 14 Jun 2012 12:48:01 -0700 (PDT} 
To: Richard Kahn < 
Cc: Lesley Groff < 
Subject: Re: Fwd: press releases 

Hi Rich, 

great. Thanks. I will let you know when I receive it. 

best, 

cell: 
email: 

-- On Thu, 6/14/12, Richard Kahn wrote: 

From: Richard Kahn < 
Subject: Fwd: press releases 
To: 
Cc: "Lesley Groff" < 
Date: Thursday, June 14, 2012, 2:34 PM 

i am sending wire for expenses now 
please confirm receipt 
thank you 

PLEASE NOTE EFFECTIVE JUNE 5TH MY CONTACT INFO WILL 
BE AS FOLLOWS: 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York New York 10022 
tel 
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fax 
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Lesley Groff 
Date: June 14, 2012 11:10:13 M EDT 
To: Rich Kahn > 
Subject: Fwd: press releases 

Begin forwarded message: 

Date: June 14, 2012 11:05:12 AM EDT 
To: Lesley Groff < 
Cc: Jeffrey Epstein 
<jeevacationacimail com> 
Subject: press releases 

Hi Lesley, 

Attached is a list of the press release costs: two in arrears and 5 that I am going to send out 
starting today. The total is $2,613 plus $4,000 for my June 15th wire if Jeffrey wants to send 
that. Thank you! Let me know if you need by bank info. take care, 

item title date cost 

press release Intl Peace Institute 21-May-12 $ 170.00 

press release Intl Peace Institute 21-May-12 $ 349.00 

press release Melanoma Research Alliance 27-May-12 $ 349.00 

press release The Edeyo Foundation 14-Jun-12 $ 349.00 
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press release 
The See Forever Foundation 14-Jun-12 $ 349.00 

press release The Ovarian Cancer Research 14-Jun-12 $ 349.00 

press release Alzheimer's Association 14-Jun-12 $ 349.00 

press release Ntl. MS Society 14-Jun-12 $ 349.00 

TOTAL: $ 2,613.00 

cell: 
email: 
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