
To: Jeffrey EpsteinUeevacationagmail.comj 
From: George Reenstra 
Sent Tue 5/1/2012 6:59:21 PM 
Subject: RE: FW: 

No, Sikorsky pays me as a rep, you paid me on the sale to Aetna and Lerner and I was 
paid on the sale of the B to the drilling company ...the B deal was when you bought it, 
never took title to it left it in my name and then I sold it for you 

George Reenstra 

Mobile: 

Email 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailtoleevacation@gmail.com] 
Sent: Tuesday, May 01, 2012 2:54 PM 
To: George Reenstra 
Subject: Re: FW: 

did you receve payments form any other entity , direct or indirect with regard these transactions./? 

On Tue, May 1, 2012 at 2:41 PM, George Reenstra wrote: 

On each of your C++ purchases from Sikorsky I made approx 250k. Selling your C++ 
to Lerner I made 100k, I think on the sale of the B model I made 100k. 

George Reenstra 

Mobile: 

Email: 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:jeevacaboneomall.corn]
Sent: Tuesday, May 01, 2012 2:40 PM 
To: George Reenstra 
Subject: Re: FW: 
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I would like to review with you the commission you received from all purchases and sales of my 
helicopters. . this is to include third party payments, sikorsky, ctc. thanks. please proves. 

On Tue, May 1, 2012 at 2:33 PM, George Reenstra wrote: 

Darren advised that you and I would talk about the final payments. I have attached the 
emails between us on that subject. As you can see I was paid on the sale of the 
C++,this was separate from the split on 472. We then agreed to split the profit on the 
sale of 472. The trade value was 1.5m, I sold it for you for 2.2m For a gross profit of 
700k My sales expenses were 7500 ( Darren has all the documentation ) I was also 
paid 100k at the closing. I have asked for over a month what your costs were so we 
could settle this as we agreed. 

I am on my cell an available 

George Reenstra 

Mobile: 

Email: 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:ieevacationaamail.coml 
Sent: Thursday, June 09, 2011 5:47 PM 
To: George Reenstra 
Subject: Re: 

yes 

On Thu, Jun 9, 2011 at 5:26 PM, George Reenstra wrote: 

Yes on the numbers and yes we split the profit on 472 however I do get my 100k for the 
sale of 750 above the 472 profit split at the closing of 750 

George Reenstra 

Aircraft Services Group Inc 
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Website: www.youriet.com 

Email: 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:ieevacation@)gmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, June 09, 2011 2:49 PM 
To: lvjet; George Reenstra 
Cc: Richard Kahn 
Subject: 

the deal george and i agreed, he now needs to go to aetvna. 11 .9 for 750 1.5 for 472.. profit 
after all costs will be split 50/50 on the sale .. with george. 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail,com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any pan thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail,com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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