
To: Jeffrey Epsteitevacationagmail.comj 
From: BMG 
Sent Sat 6/16/2012 8:15:36 PM 
Subject: Re: 

Will need to determine cost to repair first vs selling as is 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jun 16, 2012, at 4:11 PM, Jeffrey Epstein leevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

and bob cat? 

On Sat, Jun 16, 2012 at 3:56 PM, BMG wrote: 

Ok 
Blue book on ranger around 5k 
Track-hoe value has not been determined yet have offer of 5 k 
Midnight did not splash needed steering part should arrive Monday 
Pans for sprayer ordered 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jun 16, 2012, at 3:39 PM, Jeffrey Epstein leevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

I sold the ford ranger to peter for 6k.. you can sell calypso to carlos 
for 10-12/ .. is the 320 track hoe worth anything.? , jules wants to 
buy it..? , I assumcr midnight expres did not get finished today?. 
pleasa have the mechanic fix the bobcat. and other water sprayer. 
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