o Adam iy - sovcic S

Cc: Jeffrei Eistein['eewaaat:on@gma:l.cnm]
From:

Sent: Tue 5/22/2012 6:20:33 PM
Subject: Re: Payment

can you please explain your wire in the amount of 54,438 .36
i clearly explained that monthly default interest was $6,000
if yvou planned on sending a different amount shouldn't I have been notified. .

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F
New York, NY 10065

On May 21, 2012, at 10:42 AM, Adam Bly wrote:

Perhaps there is some confusion but I did not receive $6000.

Sent from my iPhone

On May 21, 2012, at 10:21 AM, "Richard Kahn" _wmm:

can you please confirm wire was sent in the amount of 6,000 as 1 do not see funds in jee
account
thank you

Richard Kahn
HBRK Associates Inc.
301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F
New York, NY 10065

On May 18, 2012, at 3:12 PM, Adam Bly wrote:

Rich,
FYI: Seed is wiring funds to me today and I will be wiring those funds
to you once they hit my account.

Best,
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Adam

Adam Bly
Founder & CEQ
Seed

NOTICE: If received in error, please destroy and notify sender, and
make no further use, disclosure, or distribution. This email and
any attachments may contain information subject to
confidentiality obligations, and sender does not waive
confidentiality or privilege.
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