To:  Craig Marti . Richarc < (.

From: Jeffrey Epstein
Sent: Sun 5/20/2012 1:09:42 PM

Subject: Fwd: Request for Bids - Santa Fe County, NM - Cypress, Inc.

--=------= Forwarded message ----------
From: BMG -
Date: Sun, May 20, 2012 at 2:51 PM
Subject: Re: Request for Bids - Santa Fe County, NM - Cypress, Inc.
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jcevacation(@gmail.com>

Single phase power already at sight therefore 100 gpm pump 6 inch casing
Anything bigger will require 3 phase power

3 phase only at existing Dakota well

3 week lead time

Would use existing infrastructure Controls, power etc to keep cost down
Will need to lay electric and pipe 800 ft

To connect to existing infrastructure

Sent from my iPhone

why not go 8 inches? benefits, burdens? time frame , we need additional
equiptment to and from new site  don't we?

On Sat, May 19, 2012 at 4:18 PM, brice gordon _ wrote:

as requested

---------- Forwarded message ----------

From: brice gordon <

Date: Wed, May 16, 2012 at 9:00 AM

Subject: Fwd: Request for Bids - Santa Fe County, NM - Cypress, Inc.

To: Rich Kahn |

as requested

---------- Forwarded message ------—---

From: brice gordon < >

Date: Wed, May 9, 2011 at /:

Subject: Fwd: Request for Bids - Santa Fe County, NM - Cypress, Inc.

To: Craig Martin -
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Ce: Zorro Ranch

requesting approval to move forward with HGS as driller for new well
they are around 15k lower than Yellow Jacket Drillers

i,m proposing 6 inch casing with 100 gpm pump, $110,996.00
i'll forward YJD proposal as well as Memo from Casey Cook regarding Variance
application with WRD

Can you please get approval ASAP, would like to meet with Bill on sight before i leave
thankyou

====-==-=- Forwarded message ----------

From: Casey Cook =

Date: Fri, May 4, 2012 at 2:49 PM

Subject: Fwd: Request for Bids - Santa Fe County, NM - Cypress, Inc.
To: brice gordon

Brice G.;

Hydrogeologic Services sent the attached bid for the new well at Zorro Ranch. HGS
estimates the 6-inch well would cost $110,996, and the B-inch well would cost
$123,816; both bids including a permanent pump.

[ expect to get a bid from Yellow Jacket Drilling later this afternoon, which [ will forward
to you. Stewart Brothers opted out of the project due to committed workload.

We can discuss these, along with the OSE Request for Variance during our 9:00 a.m.
meeting on Monday. 1 look forward to secing you then.

Please call in the meantime with any questions you may have.
Casey C.

—————————— Forwarded message ——————

From: Esperanza Cordova _
Date: Thu, May 3, 2012 at 9:08

Subject: Request for Bids - Santa Fe County, NM - Cypress, Inc.

To:"Casey W. Cook” R

Greetings,
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Attached, please find a proposal for production well installation services prepared by Bill
W. Whaley, C.P.G., Hydrogeologist. If you have questions about any aspect of
the proposal in the course of your review, please do not hesitate to call.

Respectfully yours,

Esperanza Meis for Bill W. Whaley

HydroGeologic Services, Inc.

Albuquerque, NM 87199-4716

NM License No. || | |l

WRAW
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Brice Gordon
Little Saint James
SV

Brice Gordon
Little Saint James
SV

phon [
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The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-chient privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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The mformation contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute mside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of

Jeffrey Epstein
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Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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