
To: Tulle Shvecloval 
From: Jeffrey 
Sent Tue 9/25/2012 1:52:44 AM 
Subject: Re: From TALIA SHVEDOVA 

Sony, I agree that the 387 dollars . 

Sony for all the typos .Sent from my iPhone 

On Sep 24, 2012, at 9:11 PM, Talia Shvedova e > wrote: 

Hello Jeffrey, 
How are you? Hope you bad a good weekend. 
Just wanted to make sure that my calculation for saturday night is correct: 

2K. - false table reservation and last moment cancelation at the Dream hotel downtown 
for upstairs (PHD club) and downstairs ( Electric room), for Angelo - the manager 
for those places. 

5K - for Talia Shvedova & organizing work -2.5K each 

$387.00 - expencies for drinks and snacks for girls during waiting for the guests at the 
dream hotel. (copies of the checks will be send in separated emails) 

We accepting payment in cash in following 7 days. 

Thanks, and best regards, 
Talia Shvedova 
Cell.: 
Email: 
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